
Address
B&B Maintenance 

Services, Inc.
BJM Construction 
Enterprises, Inc.

Boulder Creek 
Landscape

Laser Industries, Inc.
Mcknight Enterprise, 

LLC 
PTC Properties LLC Sandbar Builders, LLC

Steve's Landscaping 
Plus

830 David St, Franklin Square No Bid $12,500.00 $1,261.17 No Bid No Bid $9,760.00 $11,000.00 No Bid
111 Hempstead Ave, Malverne No Bid $12,500.00 $1,697.41 No Bid No Bid $9,760.00 $11,000.00 No Bid
14 Pearsall Ave, Lynbrook No Bid $12,500.00 $395.65 No Bid No Bid $9,760.00 $11,000.00 No Bid
330 Nassau Blvd, Garden City No Bid $12,500.00 $828.34 No Bid No Bid $9,760.00 $11,000.00 No Bid
566 Greenway Ave, West Hempstead No Bid $12,500.00 $699.95 No Bid No Bid $9,760.00 $11,000.00 No Bid
102 DeBevoise, Roosevelt No Bid $12,500.00 $806.83 No Bid No Bid $9,760.00 $11,000.00 No Bid
1 Ketchams Road, Hicksville No Bid $12,500.00 $956.62 No Bid No Bid $9,760.00 $11,000.00 No Bid
273 Southwood Circle, Syosset No Bid $12,500.00 $490.12 No Bid No Bid $9,760.00 $11,000.00 No Bid
604 Woodbury Road, Plainview                                                                                                                                                                                           No Bid $12,500.00 $1,320.03 No Bid No Bid $9,760.00 $11,000.00 No Bid

No Bid $112,500.00 $8,456.12 No Bid No Bid $87,840.00 $99,000.00 No Bid
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Mcknight Enterprise, 

LLC 
PTC Properties LLC Sandbar Builders, LLC

Steve's Landscaping 
Plus

2541 Natta Blvd, Bellmore No Bid $12,500.00 $913.81 No Bid $10,692.00 $13,750.00 $16,000.00 $14,445.00
7 North Butehorn St., Bethpage No Bid $12,500.00 $449.30 No Bid $10,167.00 $13,750.00 $16,000.00 $14,445.00
12 Maple Ave, Farmingdale No Bid $12,500.00 $1,537.36 No Bid $12,442.00 $13,750.00 $16,000.00 $14,445.00
1150 Merritts Road, S. Farmingdale No Bid $12,500.00 $459.97 No Bid $23,817.00 $13,750.00 $16,000.00 $14,445.00
1059 Park Blvd, Massapequa Park No Bid $12,500.00 $704.23 No Bid $13,142.00 $13,750.00 $16,000.00 $14,445.00
22 Greene Ave, Amityville No Bid $12,500.00 $513.63 No Bid $16,957.00 $13,750.00 $16,000.00 $14,445.00
315 Little Plains Road, Huntington No Bid $12,500.00 $3,771.48 No Bid $17,392.00 $13,750.00 $16,000.00 $14,445.00
115 Manor Road, Huntington No Bid $12,500.00 $1,859.22 No Bid $13,107.00 $13,750.00 $16,000.00 $14,445.00
211 Lenox Rd,Huntington No Bid $12,500.00 $916.36 No Bid $6,142.00 $13,750.00 $16,000.00 $14,445.00

No Bid $112,500.00 $11,125.36 No Bid $123,858.00 $123,750.00 $144,000.00 $130,005.00
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184 West Shore Road, No Bid $100,000.00 $1,352.81 No Bid $38,500.00 $58,000.00 $30,000.00 $35,000.00
No Bid $100,000.00 $1,352.81 No Bid $38,500.00 $58,000.00 $30,000.00 $35,000.00

Address
B&B Maintenance 

Services, Inc.
BJM Construction 
Enterprises, Inc.

Boulder Creek 
Landscape

Laser Industries, Inc.
Mcknight Enterprise, 

LLC 
PTC Properties LLC Sandbar Builders, LLC

Steve's Landscaping 
Plus

901 Melville Estates, Melville $6,000.00 $11,500.00 $962.80 No Bid $16,312.50 $32,000.00 $7,900.00 $18,440.00
902 Melville Estates, Melville $6,000.00 $11,500.00 $437.75 No Bid $16,312.50 $32,000.00 $7,900.00 $18,440.00
903 Melville Estates, Melville $6,000.00 $11,500.00 $377.74 No Bid $16,695.50 $32,000.00 $7,900.00 $18,440.00
904 Melville Estates, Melville $6,000.00 $11,500.00 $957.50 No Bid $16,695.50 $32,000.00 $7,900.00 $18,440.00
905 Melville Estates, Melville $6,000.00 $11,500.00 $598.50 No Bid $16,695.50 $32,000.00 $7,900.00 $18,440.00
906 Melville Estates, Melville $6,000.00 $11,500.00 $883.35 No Bid $16,695.50 $32,000.00 $7,900.00 $18,440.00
907 Melville Estates, Melville $6,000.00 $11,500.00 $563.66 No Bid $16,695.50 $32,000.00 $7,900.00 $18,440.00
908 Melville Estates, Melville $6,000.00 $11,500.00 $619.56 No Bid $16,695.50 $32,000.00 $7,900.00 $18,440.00
909 Melville Estates, Melville $6,000.00 $11,500.00 $987.41 No Bid $16,695.50 $32,000.00 $7,900.00 $18,440.00
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910 Melville Estates, Melville $6,000.00 $11,500.00 $1,981.26 No Bid $16,695.50 $32,000.00 $7,900.00 $18,440.00
911 Melville Estates, Melville $6,000.00 $11,500.00 $549.47 No Bid $16,695.50 $32,000.00 $7,900.00 $18,440.00
912 Melville Estates, Melville $6,000.00 $11,500.00 $1,022.75 No Bid $16,695.50 $32,000.00 $7,900.00 $18,440.00

$72,000.00 $138,000.00 $9,941.75 No Bid $199,580.00 $384,000.00 $94,800.00 $221,280.00
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913 Rainbow Commons, Melville $6,000.00 $11,500.00 $517.62 No Bid $13,223.25 $17,400.00 $7,900.00 $18,990.00
914 Rainbow Commons, Melville $6,000.00 $11,500.00 $476.47 No Bid $13,223.25 $17,400.00 $7,900.00 $18,990.00
915 Rainbow Commons, Melville $6,000.00 $11,500.00 $758.39 No Bid $13,223.25 $17,400.00 $7,900.00 $18,990.00
916 Rainbow Commons, Melville $6,000.00 $11,500.00 $753.27 No Bid $13,223.25 $17,400.00 $7,900.00 $18,990.00
917 Rainbow Commons, Melville $6,000.00 $11,500.00 $980.08 No Bid $13,223.25 $17,400.00 $7,900.00 $18,990.00
918 Rainbow Commons, Melville $6,000.00 $11,500.00 $401.83 No Bid $13,223.25 $17,400.00 $7,900.00 $18,990.00
919 Rainbow Commons, Melville $6,000.00 $11,500.00 $741.90 No Bid $13,223.25 $17,400.00 $7,900.00 $18,990.00
920 Rainbow Commons, Melville $6,000.00 $11,500.00 $672.95 No Bid $13,223.25 $17,400.00 $7,900.00 $18,990.00
921 Rainbow Commons, Melville $6,000.00 $11,500.00 $412.39 No Bid $13,223.25 $17,400.00 $7,900.00 $18,990.00
922 Rainbow Commons, Melville $6,000.00 $11,500.00 $294.02 No Bid $13,223.25 $17,400.00 $7,900.00 $18,990.00
923 Rainbow Commons, Melville $6,000.00 $11,500.00 $467.49 No Bid $13,223.25 $17,400.00 $7,900.00 $18,990.00
924 Rainbow Commons, Melville $6,000.00 $11,500.00 $1,011.28 No Bid $12,223.25 $17,400.00 $7,900.00 $18,990.00

$72,000.00 $138,000.00 $7,487.69 No Bid $157,679.00 $208,800.00 $94,800.00 $227,880.00
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25 Echo Lane, Melville $5,000.00 $12,000.00 $946.93 No Bid $6,492.00 $29,000.00 $7,050.00 $15,500.00
123 Carmen Road, Melville $5,000.00 $12,000.00 $1,210.85 No Bid $12,267.00 $29,000.00 $7,050.00 $15,500.00
129 Carmen Road, Melville $5,000.00 $12,000.00 $1,355.51 No Bid $12,792.00 $29,000.00 $7,050.00 $15,500.00
195 Old South Path, Melville $5,000.00 $12,000.00 $1,805.83 No Bid $15,942.00 $29,000.00 $7,050.00 $15,500.00
197 Old South Path, Melville $5,000.00 $12,000.00 $836.61 No Bid $14,717.00 $29,000.00 $7,050.00 $15,500.00
214 Old South Path, Melville $5,000.00 $12,000.00 $440.58 No Bid $5,617.00 $29,000.00 $7,050.00 $15,500.00
218 Old South Path, Melville $5,000.00 $12,000.00 $523.28 No Bid $5,617.00 $29,000.00 $7,050.00 $15,500.00
220 Old South Path, Melville $5,000.00 $12,000.00 $935.02 No Bid $11,917.00 $29,000.00 $7,050.00 $15,500.00
30 Bagatelle Road, Dix Hills $5,000.00 $12,000.00 $769.33 No Bid $10,392.00 $30,000.00 $7,050.00 $15,500.00
2 Pam Drive, Commack $5,000.00 $12,000.00 $1,143.03 No Bid $9,292.00 $30,000.00 $7,050.00 $15,500.00
2 Marshmallow Drive, $5,000.00 $12,000.00 $570.94 No Bid $10,342.00 $30,000.00 $7,050.00 $15,500.00
17 West Birch St., West Islip $5,000.00 $12,000.00 $411.24 No Bid $10,167.00 $30,000.00 $7,050.00 $15,500.00
57 Washington Ave, Islip $5,000.00 $12,000.00 $357.40 No Bid $9,117.00 $30,000.00 $7,050.00 $15,500.00

$65,000.00 $156,000.00 $11,306.55 No Bid $134,671.00 $382,000.00 $91,650.00 $201,500.00
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331 N. Holbrook Rd, $5,000.00 $16,000.00 $739.89 $6,000.00 No Bid $32,425.00 $20,000.00 No Bid
772 Hawkins Ave,  Lake Ronkonkoma $5,000.00 $16,000.00 $942.91 $6,000.00 No Bid $32,425.00 $20,000.00 No Bid
53 Wyanet St, Seldem $5,000.00 $16,000.00 $1,721.76 $6,000.00 No Bid $32,425.00 $20,000.00 No Bid
206 (A) Oxhead Road, Centereach $5,000.00 $16,000.00 $1,106.47 $6,000.00 No Bid $32,425.00 $20,000.00 No Bid
206 (B) Oxhead Road, Centereach $5,000.00 $16,000.00 $1,207.36 $6,000.00 No Bid $32,425.00 $20,000.00 No Bid
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65 North Washington Ave, Centereach $5,000.00 $16,000.00 $698.38 $6,000.00 No Bid $32,425.00 $20,000.00 No Bid
8 North Morris Ave, $5,000.00 $16,000.00 $1,023.38 $6,000.00 No Bid $32,425.00 $20,000.00 No Bid

$35,000.00 $112,000.00 $7,440.15 $42,000.00 No Bid $226,975.00 $140,000.00 No Bid
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LLC 
PTC Properties LLC Sandbar Builders, LLC

Steve's Landscaping 
Plus

166 Division St, Blue Point $5,000.00 $14,000.00 $923.56 $6,000.00 No Bid $36,000.00 $20,000.00 No Bid
718 Middle Road, Bayport $5,000.00 $14,000.00 $1,939.95 $6,000.00 No Bid $36,000.00 $20,000.00 No Bid
9 Chapel Ave, Brookhaven $5,000.00 $14,000.00 $805.26 $6,000.00 No Bid $36,000.00 $20,000.00 No Bid
8 Northridge Drive, Coram $5,000.00 $14,000.00 $667.25 $6,000.00 No Bid $36,000.00 $20,000.00 No Bid
1122 Old Town Rd, Coram $5,000.00 $14,000.00 $1,371.98 $6,000.00 No Bid $36,000.00 $20,000.00 No Bid
85 (A) W. Yaphank Rd, Coram $7,500.00 $14,000.00 $4,059.14 $6,000.00 No Bid $36,000.00 $20,000.00 No Bid
85 (B) W. Yaphank Rd, Coram $7,500.00 $14,000.00 $4,046.33 $6,000.00 No Bid $36,000.00 $20,000.00 No Bid
44 Timber Trail, Medford $5,000.00 $14,000.00 $1,026.16 $6,000.00 No Bid $36,000.00 $20,000.00 No Bid

$45,000.00 $112,000.00 $14,839.63 $48,000.00 No Bid $288,000.00 $160,000.00 No Bid
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PTC Properties LLC Sandbar Builders, LLC

Steve's Landscaping 
Plus

2 Groton Ave, Port Jefferson $5,500.00 $19,000.00 $466.97 $6,000.00 No Bid $33,600.00 $25,000.00 No Bid
64 (A) Ridge Rd, Ridge $5,500.00 $19,000.00 $1,191.19 $6,000.00 No Bid $33,600.00 $25,000.00 No Bid
64 (B) Ridge Rd, Ridge $5,500.00 $19,000.00 $1,291.29 $6,000.00 No Bid $33,600.00 $25,000.00 No Bid
64 (C) Ridge Rd, Ridge $5,500.00 $19,000.00 $1,191.29 $6,000.00 No Bid $33,600.00 $25,000.00 No Bid
11 Sprague Dr, Center Moriches $5,500.00 $19,000.00 $1,237.91 $6,000.00 No Bid $33,600.00 $25,000.00 No Bid
26 E. Moriches Blvd, East Moriches $5,500.00 $19,000.00 $1,008.72 $6,000.00 No Bid $33,600.00 $25,000.00 No Bid

$33,000.00 $114,000.00 $6,387.37 $36,000.00 No Bid $201,600.00 $150,000.00 No Bid
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